Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest

Bid Results
PULP IS IN TONS SOLD IN TONS FOR ANY AND ALL SALES ON THE NHAL
PW PR PJ T F S A H [¢] MX MR BA PW PR H MR BW MX [¢] ASH MH BA TOTAL BID
Tract#| PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS AMOUNT BIDDER
06-25[ $32.52 [$41.20 $20.75 $13.32 [$13.32 $668,419.10 [TNT TIMBER IMPROVEMENT
07-25| $23.53 [$23.53 $22.50 $25.00 [$16.80 $140,402.40 |CENTRAL TIMBER
08-25| $23.50 $3.50 $19.50 $26.00 [$23.00 $265,295.00 | TWIN FOREST PRODUCTS LLC
10-25 NO BID
11-25 NO BID
12-25 $9.00 $9.00 $9.00 $106,875.00 |GA DALBECK
15-25 NO BID
16-25)| $31.03 $21.53 $21.53 $351,894.00 [CENTRAL TIMBER
19-25 $7.00 $16.60 $18.60 [$18.60 $170.00 $161,255.00 |CENTRAL TIMBER
20-25| $25.00 {$30.00 $1.50 $12.00 $45.63 [ $9.00 $711,880.50 INORTHWEST HARDWOODS
21-25 $15.00 $27.00 $36.50 [$15.00 $200.00 [$200.00 $486,225.00 |GA DALBECK
22-25 $32.64 $9.00 $20.65 $15.00 $125,721.00 |GA DALBECK
01-24 NO BID
988-25 NO BID
$27.12 [$31.84 $9.00 [#DIV/0!] $7.20 [#DIV/0!|$18.84 |#DIV/0![$27.51 |$15.69 |#DIV/O![#DIV/0!| $185.00 |$200.00 | #DIV/0! | #DIV/O! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! [ #DIV/O! | #DIV/O! | #DIV/O! | #DIV/O! [ $3,017,967.00

AVE




Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract 06-25 Xeric Fine Pine

Minimum Bid Amount $403,578.00
PW PR PJ T F S A H o MX MR BA PW PR H MR BW MX o ASH MH BA TOTAL BID
Bidders Name| PULP | PULP | PULP PULP | PULP | PULP PULP PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP [[ LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS [ LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS AMOUNT
4" Top| 3245 9730 3950 3500 2510
Whole Tree
TNT TIMBER | $32.52 | $41.20 $20.75 $13.32 | $13.32
IMPROVEMENT $668,419.10
CENTRAL TIMBER INC| $25.00 | $35.57 $20.10 $16.10 | $16.10
$603,377.10
WIITALA & VOZKA| $27.00 | $33.00 $21.00 $21.00 | $14.00
LOGGING $600,295.00
BIEWER WISCONSIN| $20.00 | $32.00 $13.00 $17.00 | $13.00
SAWMILL $519,740.00
SCHREIBER TRUCKING| $18.02 [ $18.02 $18.02 $18.02 | $18.02
& LOGGING INC $413,288.70
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
AVERAGE $24.51 | $31.96 | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! |#DIV/0!|#DIV/0! $18.57 |#DIV/0!| $17.09 | $14.89 [#DIV/0!|#DIV/0!| #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/O! [ #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0!




Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract 07-25 Yonder Pine & Popple

Minimum Bid Amount $58,082.50
PW PR PJ T F S A H (o] MX MR BA PW PR H MR BW MX (o] ASH MH BA TOTAL BID
Bidders Name| PULP | PULP | PULP PULP | PULP | PULP PULP PULP | PULP PULP PULP | PULP || LOGS | LOGS [ LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS AMOUNT
4" Top 790 290 2700 960 1800
Whole Tree 990 360 3375 1170 2300
CENTRAL TIMBER | $23.53 |$23.53 $22.50 $25.00 $16.80
$140,402.40
TWIN FOREST | $14.00 | $22.00 $18.30 $26.25 $16.50
PRODUCTS $121,750.00
FINK FOREST| $20.00 |$20.00
PRODUCTS $16.10 $13.00 $13.00 $121,047.50
COUNTRY FOREST| $13.00 | $10.00 $12.00 $13.00 $13.00
PRODUCTS $81,450.00
SCHREIBER TRUCKING| $10.21 | $10.21 $10.21 $10.21 $10.21
& LOGGING $66,773.40
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
AVERAGE $16.15 | $17.15 | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0O! |#DIV/0!|#DIV/0! $15.82 |#DIV/0!| $17.49 $13.90 |#DIV/0!|#DIV/0!| #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! [ #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/O! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0!| #DIV/O!




Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract 08-25 Uptown Big Arb Aspen

Minimum Bid Amount $133,462.00
PW PR PJ T F S A H (o] MX MR BA PW PR H MR BW MX (o] ASH MH BA TOTAL BID
Bidders Name| PULP | PULP | PULP PULP | PULP | PULP PULP PULP | PULP PULP PULP | PULP || LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS LOGS LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS AMOUNT
4" Top 310 1100 9460 575 2380
Whole Tree 390 1375 11825 700 3050
TWIN FOREST | $23.50 $3.50 $19.50 $26.00 $23.00
PRODUCTS $265,295.00
WILSON FORESTRY| $6.00 $6.00 $23.00 $8.00 $12.00
$259,200.00
FINK FOREST PROD| $20.00 $10.00
$16.10 $13.00 $13.00 $256,332.50
CENTRAL TIMBER INC| $30.00 $5.00 $17.90 $30.00 $21.09
$251,578.20
WIITALA & VOZKA| $21.00 $5.00 $20.00 $15.00 $12.00
$238,395.00
COUNTRY FOREST| $10.00 $3.00 $12.00 $6.00 $12.00
PRODUCTS $151,930.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
AVERAGE $18.42 | #DIV/0!| #DIV/0! | #DIV/O! | $5.42 |#DIV/0! $18.08 |#DIV/0!| $16.33 $15.52 | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/O! | #DIV/0!| #DIV/O! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/O! | #DIV/O! | #DIV/0! [ #DIV/0!| #DIV/O!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract 10-25 Deerfoot

$10,997.00

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

MX
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

65

230

250

230

90

Whole Tree

NO BIDS

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract 11-25 Otterslide

$31,970.00

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

MX
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

710

85

810

Whole Tree

NO BIDS

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract 12-25 Jutie Garland

$75,445.00

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

MX
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

3100

8250

525

Whole Tree

GA DALBECK

$9.00

$9.00

$9.00

$106,875.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

$9.00

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

$9.00

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

$9.00

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract 15-25 Dead Ice

$22,121.00

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

MX
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

95

2350

Whole Tree

NO BIDS

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract 16-25 West Plum Aspen

$176,190.00

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

MX
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

3500

8200

3100

Whole Tree

CENTRAL TIMBER INC

$31.03

$21.53

$21.53

$351,894.00

WIITALA VOZKA

$24.00

$18.60

$15.60

$284,880.00

SCHREIBER TRUCKING
& LOGGING INC

$12.31

$12.31

$12.31

$182,188.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

$22.45

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

$17.48

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

$16.48

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract 19-25 Ristow's Refuge

$130,800.00

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

MX
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

875

5150

1150

2000

65

Whole Tree

CENTRAL TIMBER

$7.00

$16.60

$18.60

$18.60

$170.00

$161,255.00

COUNTRY FOREST
PRODUCTS

$5.00

$14.00

$20.00

$15.00

$100.00

$135,975.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

$6.00

#DIV/0!

$15.30

#DIV/0!

$19.30

$16.80

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

$135.00

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract 20-25 Boulder Tower

Minimum Bid Amount $306,495.00

PW PR PJ T F S A H o] MX MR BA PW PR H MR BW MX o] ASH MH BA TOTAL BID

Bidders Name| PULP | PULP | PULP PULP | PULP | PULP PULP PULP | PULP PULP | PULP | PULP || LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS AMOUNT
4" Top 975 500 525 3400 13600 1150

Whole Tree

NORTHWEST| $25.00 | $30.00 $1.50 $12.00 $45.63 $9.00

HARDWOODS 711,880.50
CENTRAL TIMBER| $21.00 |$21.00 $6.00 $17.09 $32.09 | $15.00

$545,905.00
JW LOGGING | $20.00 |$20.00 $2.00 $12.00 $28.76 | $12.00

OF CHIPPEWA FALLS $476,286.00
TWIN FOREST | $12.50 | $12.50 $1.00 $6.75 $31.40 $3.80

PRODUCTS LLC $473,322.50
COUNTRY FOREST | $10.00 [ $13.00 $4.00 $11.00 $29.00 | $12.00

PRODUCTS $463,950.00
CENTRAL WISCONSIN| $16.90 [$10.38 $0.94 $3.13 $26.50 | $10.00

LUMBER $404,703.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE $17.57 |$17.81 | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | $2.57 |#DIV/0! $10.33 |#DIV/0!]| $32.23 | $10.30 [#DIV/0!|#DIV/0!| #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0!| #DIV/0! | #DIV/0!| #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0!| #DIV/0!




Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest

Tract 21-25 Stupendous Pines

Minimum Bid Amount $275,713.00
PW PR PJ T F S A H (o] MX MR BA PW PR H MR BW MX (o] ASH MH BA TOTAL BID
Bidders Name| PULP | PULP | PULP PULP | PULP | PULP PULP PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP | PULP || LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS [ LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS AMOUNT

4" Top 440 7450 1900 875 700 280

Whole Tree

GA DALBECK $15.00 $27.00 $36.50 | $15.00 $200.00 | $200.00
$486,225.00

CENTRAL TIMBER INC $11.00 $23.30 $35.00 | $18.00 $227.00 | $211.00
$478,655.00

TNT IMPROVEMENT $2.01 $22.92 $20.01 $13.32 $225.00 | $274.00
$455,532.40

SMOLA ENTERPRISE $1.00 $23.00 $35.00 $7.50 $175.00 | $210.00
$426,152.50

WIITALA & VOZKA $15.00 $23.00 $23.00 | $16.00 $170.00 | $170.00
$402,250.00

BIEWER WISCONSIN $6.00 $14.00 $22.00 | $14.00 $127.00 | $197.00
SAWMILL $305,050.00

SCHREIBER TRUCKING $19.20 $19.20 $19.20 | $19.20 $100.00 | $100.00
& LOGGING INC $302,768.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

AVERAGE #DIV/0! | #DIV/0!| #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | $9.89 [#DIV/0! $21.77 | #DIV/0!| $27.24 | $14.72 |#DIV/0! | #DIV/0!| $174.86 | $194.57 | #DIV/0! [ #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! [ #DIV/0!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract 01-24 Ruffed Grouse

$25,681.00

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

MX
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

525

1100

440

Whole Tree

NO BIDS

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract 988-25 Spruce Grouse

$14,190.00

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

BW
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

1550

875

160

800

45

Whole Tree

NO BIDS

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

MX
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

Whole Tree

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

MX
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

Whole Tree

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

MX
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

Whole Tree

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

MX
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

Whole Tree

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Minimum Bid Amount

Northern Highland-American Legion State Forest
Tract

Bidders Name

PW
PULP

PR
PULP

PJ
PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

PULP

MX
PULP

MR
PULP

BA
PULP

PW
LOGS

PR
LOGS

LOGS

MR
LOGS

BW
LOGS

MX
LOGS

LOGS

ASH
LOGS

MH
LOGS

BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

4" Top

Whole Tree

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

AVERAGE

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!

#DIV/0!




Northern Highland-American Le

Tract
Minimum Bid Amount
PW PR PJ T F S A H (o)
Bidders Name| PULP | PULP | PULP PULP | PULP | PULP PULP PULP | PULP
4" Top
Whole Tree

AVERAGE #DIV/0! | #DIV/0!| #DIV/O! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/O!I{#DIV/0!] #DIV/0! |#DIV/0!| #DIV/0!




xgion State Forest

MX MR BA PW PR H MR BW MX o ASH MH
PULP | PULP [ PULP || LOGS | LOGS [ LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS | LOGS
#DIV/0! | #DIV/O! {#DIV/O!| #DIV/0! | #DIV/O! [ #DIV/0!| #DIV/O! | #DIV/O!| #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! | #DIV/0! [ #DIV/0!




BA
LOGS

TOTAL BID
AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

#DIV/0!
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