Timber Sale Bid Summary

Ladysmith, WI 54848

RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E.
S-115

Tract#  Acres

Bids High Bidder

Bid Value Minimum Bid

PHONE (715) 532-2113

Bid Open Date

3-24
6-24
7-24
8-24
9-24
10-24
11-24
16-23
16-24
21-21

95

24

37

57

123

74

53

55

83

187
Bids:
Sales:

1
1

2 Northwest Hardwoods 81,110.00 0.00
3 J&J Logging Enterprises LL 23,739.70 0.00
4 J.W Logging 67,100.00 0.00
1 Lionel Klein 26,650.00 0.00
2 Northwest Hardwoods 92,880.00 0.00
2 T&RW Logging LLC 28,252.00 0.00
2 Kendall Logging 19,320.00 0.00
1 Kendall Logging 62,660.00 0.00
1 Kendall Logging 68,925.00 0.00
1 Paul Wojcik, PAW LLC 4.410.00

9  Total Value: 475,046.70 0.00
0 \

May 14, 2024
Weighted
Species Volume UOM  Max Bid | Average
Basswood Sawlogs 235.00 MBF 110.00 90.32
Hard Maple Sawlogs 198.00 MBF 425.00 346.79
Mixed Hardwood Sawlogs 393.00 MBF 325.00 260.00
Red Oak Sawlogs 614.00 MBF 565.00 401.72
Aspen Pulp 7,035.00 Tons 24.00 17.80
Bass Wood Pulp 3,795.00 Tons 10.00 5:51
Mixed Hdwd Pulp 17,190.00 Tons 12.01 8.23
Oak Pulp 5,320.00 Tons 12.01 8.22
Red Oak Pulp 2,870.00 Tons 8.00 8.00
Spruce Pulp 1,500.00 Tons 0.75 0.75
4,250.00 Tons 0.75 0.75

Tamarack Pulp
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RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E. PHONE (715) 532-2113
s-115
Ladysmith, WI 54848

Rusk County, Wlsconsm

Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 21-21

Winning Bid
Paul Wojcik, PAW LLC 4.410.00

Paul Wojcik, PAW LLC
20T-A 100 0.750
20T-M 30 0.750
20T-S 1500 0.750
20T-T 4250 0.750

Bid Total:

Inc[]
75.00
22.50
1,125.00
3,187.50
4,410.00

5/16/24 8:25:57 AM

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E.

S-115

Ladysmith, WI 54848

Kendall Logging Inc[]
10-OR 8 350.000  2,800.00
20T-A 3130 18.000 56,340.00
20T-M 330 8.000  2,640.00
20T-0 110 8.000 880.00

Bid Total: 62,660.00

5/16/24 8:26:27 AM

Rusk County, Wisconsin

Bid Comparison Report
16-23

Kendall Logging

Tract:

PHONE (715) 532-2113

Winning Bid
62,660.00

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E. PHONE (715) 532-2113

S-115
Ladysmith, WI 54848

Rusk County, Wisconsin

Bid Comparison Report

Tract: 1-24
Winning Bid
' NO BID 0.00 U
NO BID Inc
10-BA 5 0.000 0.00
10-MH 15  0.000 0.00
10-MX 20  0.000 0.00
10-OR 5 0.000 0.00
20T-B 45  0.000 0.00
20T-M 1250  0.000 0.00
20T-0 50 0.000 0.00
Bid Total: 0.00

5/16/24 9:09:59 AM Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E. PHONE . (715) 532-2113

S-115
Ladysmith, WI 54848

Rusk County, Wisconsin

Bid Comparison Report

NO BID
10-BA
10-MH
10-MX
10-OR
20T-B
20T-M
20T-O

Tract: 2-24
Winning Bid
NO BID 0.00 U
Inc A :
15 0.000 0.00
30 0.000 0.00
20 0.000 0.00
50 0.000 0.00
300 0.000 0.00
950 0.000 0.00
400 0.000 0.00
Bid Total: 0.00

5/16/24 9:07:43 AM

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E. PHONE (715)532-2113

S-115
Ladysmith, WI 54848

Bid Comparison Report

Tract: 3-24
Winning Bid
Northwest Hardwoods 81,110.00
J.W Logging 73,530.00 U
J.W Logging Inc [_]||Northwest Hardwoods Inc[]

10-BA 15 75.000 1,125.00 || 10-BA 15 110.000 1,650.00
10-MH 25 375.000 9,375.00 || 10-MH 25 410.000 10,250.00
10-MX 45 275.000 12,375.00 || 10-MX 45 250.000 11,250.00
10-OR 75 375.000 28,125.00 || 10-OR 75 450.000 33,750.00
20T-B 240 2.000 480.00 || 20T-B 240  9.000 2,160.00
20T-M 1450 9.000 13,050.00 | 20T-M 1450 9.000 13,050.00
20T-O 1000 9.000 9,000.00 || 20T-O 1000  9.000 9,000.00

Bid Total: 73,530.00 Bid Total: 81,110.00

5/16/24 8:27:32 AM Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E.

S-115

Ladysmith, WI 54848

NO BID Inc
10-BA 35 0.000 0.00
10-MH 30 0.000 0.00
10-MX 10  0.000 0.00
20T-B 525 0.000 0.00
20T-M 1350 0.000 0.00

Bid Total: 0.00

5/16/24 9:08:01 AM

NO BID

i Comty e
Bid Comparison Report

Tract:

4-24

PHONE (715) 532-2113

Winning Bid
0.000

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E. PHONE (715) 532-2113

S-115
Ladysmith, WI 54848

Rusk County, Wisconsin

Bid Comparison Report

Tract: 5-24
Winning Bid
NO BID 0.00J
NO BID Inc
10-BA 5 0.000 0.00
10-MH 5 0.000 0.00
10-MX 20 0.000 0.00
10-OR 85 0.000 0.00
20T-B 95 0.000 - 0.00
20T-M 950  0.000 0.00
20T-O 1900  0.000 0.00
Bid Total: 0.00

5/16/24 9:08:16 AM ' Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E. PHONE

S-115

Ladysmith, WI 54848

Tract:

Bid Comparison Report
6-24

J&J Logging Enterprises LLC

Northern Timber

Bid Total: 22,955.00

Burmeister Logging
Northern Timber Inc [_]||Burmeister Logging Inc []||J&J Logging Enterprises LLC  Inc[]
20T-A 1200 18.050 21,660.00 || 20T-A 1200 16.500 19,800.00 || 20T-A 1200 16.080 19,296.00
20T-M 370 3.500 1,295.00 || 20T-M 370 8.500 3,145.00 || 20T-M 370 12.010 4,443.70
Bid Total: 22,945.00 Bid Total: 23,739.70

5/16/24 8:45:23 AM

(715) 532-2113

Winning Bid
23,739.70
22,955.00
22,945.00 U

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E.

S-115

Ladysmith, WI 54848

Rusk County, Wisconsin
bbbk

PHONE (715) 532-2113

Bid Comparison Report

Tract: 7-24
Winning Bid

J.W Logging 67,100.00

J&J Logging Enterprises LLC 54,637.50 L

Burmeister Logging 51,900.00 I

David Hakes Logging, LLC 48,820.00 [
J.W Logging Inc [_]||J&J Logging Enterprises LLC  Inc[_]||David Hakes Logging, LLC Inc [] ||Burmeister Logging Inc[]
10-OR 35 450.000 15,750.00 || 10-OR 35 275.000 9,625.00 || 10-OR 35 405.000 14,175.00 || 10-OR 35 350.000 12,250.00
20T-A 1950 24.000 46,800.00 | 20T-A 1950 19.080 37,206.00 || 20T-A 1950 16.100 31,395.00 || 20T-A 1950 17.500 34,125.00
20T-M 450 7.000 3,150.00 || 20T-M 450 12.010 5,404.50 || 20T-M 450 5.000 2,250.00 || 20T-M 450 8.500 3,825.00
20T-0 200 7.000 1,400.00 || 20T-O 200 12.010 2,402.00 || 20T-O 200 5.000 1,000.00 || 20T-O 200 8.500 1,700.00
Bid Total: 67,100.00 Bid Total: 54,637.50 Bid Total: 48,820.00 Bid Total: 51,900.00

5/16/24 8:45:40 AM

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E. PHONE (715) 532-2113
S-115
Ladysmith, WI 54848

Rusk County, Wisconsin

Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 8-24

Winning Bid
Lionel Klein 26,650.00

Lionel Klein
10-BA
10-MH
10-MX
10-OR
20T-B
20T-M

| 20T-0

45 100.000
15 200.000
25 200.000
15 250.000
330 8.000
860 8.000
110  8.000
Bid Total:

Inc[]
4,500.00
3,000.00
5,000.00
3,750.00
2,640.00
6,880.00

880.00
26,650.00

5/16/24 8:45:56 AM

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

PHONE (715) 532-2113

311 Miner Ave. E.

S-115

Ladysmith, WI 54848

Bid Comparison Report

Tract:

Northwest Hardwoods

J.W Logging

J.W Logging

10-BA 28 75.000
10-MH 10 425.000
10-MX 26 275.000
10-OR 100 425.000
20T-A 180  9.000
20T-B 460 2.000
20T-M 820 9.000
20T-O 830 9.000

Bid Total:

Inc [_]||Northwest Hardwoods
2,100.00 || 10-BA 28 110.000
4,250.00 || 10-MH 10 325.000
7,150.00 || 10-MX 26 275.000

42,500.00 || 10-OR 100 565.000
1,620.00 || 20T-A 180 10.000
920.00 || 20T-B 460 10.000
7,380.00 || 20T-M 820 10.000
7,470.00 || 20T-O 830 10.000
73,390.00 Bid Total:

Inc[]
3,080.00
3,250.00
7,150.00

56,500.00
1,800.00
4,600.00
8,200.00
8,300.00

5/16/24 8:46:13 AM

92,880.00

9-24

Winning Bid
92,880.00
73,390.00 L]

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E.

S-115

Ladysmith, WI 54848

Rusk County, Wisconsin

PHONE (715) 532-2113

Bid Comparison Report

Tract:

T&R W Logging LLC
Northwest Hardwoods

[T&R W Logging LLC Inc [_]||Northwest Hardwoods Inc[]
10-BA 4 78.000 312.00 || 10-BA 4 100.000 400.00
10-MH 6 375.000 2,250.00 || 10-MH 6 200.000 1,200.00
10-MX 14 275.000 3,850.00 || 10-MX 14 200.000 2,800.00
10-OR 35 360.000 12,600.00 || 10-OR 35 325.000 11,375.00
20T-B 80 5.750 460.00 || 20T-B 80 6.000 480.00
20T-M 860 7.600 6,536.00 || 20T-M 860 6.000 5,160.00
20T-0 440 5.100 2,244.00 || 20T-O 440 6.000 2,640.00

Bid Total: 28,252.00 Bid Total: 24,055.00

5/16/24 8:46:32 AM

10-24

Winning Bid
28,252.00
24,055.00 U

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E. PHONE (715) 532-2113

S-115
Ladysmith, WI 54848

Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 11-24

Winning Bid
19,320.00

Kendall Logging
17,258.00 [

T&R W Logging LLC

Kendall Logging Inc []||T&R W Logging LLC Inc[]
10-MX 10 325.000 3,250.00 || 10-MX 10 240.000 2,400.00
10-OR 30 325.000 9,750.00 || 10-OR 30 325.000 9,750.00
20T-B 120  2.000 240.00 || 20T-B 120  5.000 600.00
20T-M 480 8.000 3,840.00 || 20T-M 480 7.000 3,360.00
20T-0 280 8.000 2,240.00 || 20T-O 280 4.100 1,148.00

Bid Total: 19,320.00 Bid Total: 17,258.00

5/16/24 8:46:49 AM

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOR

311 Miner Ave. E.

S-115

Ladysmith, WI 54848

NO BID Inc
10-BA 19  0.000 0.00
10-MH 14 0.000 0.00
10-MX 73 0.000 0.00
10-OR 14 0.000 0.00
20T-A 45  0.000 0.00
20T-B 550 0.000 0.00
20T-M 2700 0.000 0.00
20T-0 370 0.000 0.00

Bid Total: 0.00

5/16/24 9:06:45 AM

NO BID

EST ADMINISTRA

TOR

PHONE (715)532-2113

Bid Comparison Report

Tract:

12-24

Winning Bid
0.00

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOR

311 Miner Ave. E.

S-115

Ladysmith, WI 54848

NO BID
10-BA
10-MH
10-MX
10-OR
20T-A
20T-B
20T-M
20T-O

10  0.000

9 0.000

24 0.000

41 0.000

30 0.000

420 0.000

1400 0.000

1270  0.000
Bid Total:

Inc
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00

5/16/24 9:07:03 AM

NO BID

EST ADMINISTRA

TOR

PHONE (715) 532-2113

Bid Comparison Report

Tract:

13-24

Winning Bid
0.000

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E. PHONE (715) 532-2113
S-115
Ladysmith, WI 54848

Rusk County, Wisconsin

Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 14-24

NO BID
10-BA
10-MH
10-MX
10-OR
20T-A
20T-B
20T-M
20T-O

Winning Bid
NO BID 0.000J

Inc
8 0.000 0.00
11 0.000 0.00
15 0.000 0.00
24 0.000 0.00
60 0.000 0.00
170  0.000 0.00
800 0.000 0.00
450  0.000 0.00
Bid Total: 0.00

5/16/24 9:07:15 AM

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E. PHONE (715)532-2113

S-115
Ladysmith, WI 54848

Rusk County, Wisconsin

Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 15-24

) Winning Bid
NO BID ; 0.000

NO BID _Inc ’
10-BA 6 0.000 0.00
10-MH 8 0.000 0.00
10-MX 46 0.000 0.00
10-OR 12 0.000 0.00
20T-B 220 0.000 0.00
20T-M 940 0.000 0.00
20T-O 280 0.000 0.00

Bid Total: 0.00

5/16/24 9:07:26 AM

Page 1 of 1



RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E. PHONE (715) 532-2113
S-115
Ladysmith, WI 54848

Rusk Couniy, Wisconsin
=LA

Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 16-24

Winning Bid

Kendall Logging A 68,925.00

Kendall Logging Inc[]
10-BA 40 75.000 3,000.00
10-MH 20 350.000 7,000.00
10-MX 45 275.000 12,375.00
10-OR 85 350.000 29,750.00
20T-A 340 8.000 2,720.00
20T-B 240 2.000 480.00
20T-M 1200 8.000 9,600.00
20T-0 500 8.000 4,000.00

Bid Total: 68,925.00

5/16/24 8:47:14 AM Page 1 of 1



